
Il'Ieg. NO.GRlRNP/GOAl32.1 1 RNI No. GOAENGI200:!1641 0 I 
Panaji, 14th October, 2004 (Asvina .22, 1926) t SERIES I· No; 29 

~~. . .' . .. ..... ..~' oN .. ,. ..... . ..... 

OFFICIAL~GAZETTE 
. GOVERNMENT'OFGOA 

" .' . ~., .' . 

GOVERNMENT OF GOA 

Department of Law and JudiCiary 

Legal' Affairs Division 

Notification 

1013/2003-LA 

The Taxation L.aws (Amend.ment) Act: 2003 

(Central Act:No.54 of 2003), which has .been 

passed by the Parliament and assented to by the 

President of India on: 30~12~2003' and published 

in the Gazette of India, Extraordinary,Part II, 

Section 1, <:iated 31-12-2003; is hereby published 

for -general information bf the' publici: 

S. G. Mar&the, Under Secretary (Drafting).' 

Panaji, 18th May, 2004. 

THE TAXATION LAWS (AMENDMENT) 
! 

ACT,2003 

AN 

ACT 

further to ameh'd the Income-tax Act, 1961, the 
WeaIthCtax Act, 1957 and the Expenditure-tax 
Act, 1987. 

BE it enacted by Parliament in the Fifty-fourth 
Year of the Repu1::>lic of India as fol!ows:'-

CHAPTER I 

. Preliminary 

L Short title and commencement:- (1). This 
Act may be caned the Trucation Laws(Amendm~nt) 
Act, 2003. 

. (2) Save as otherwise provided i.n this Act, it 
shall be de~med to have' <;:qme into force on.the 
8th day of September, 2003. 

CHAPTER II . 

Amendments to the Income-Tax Act, 1961: 

2. Amendment of section 10.- In 
section 10 of the Income-tax Act, 1961'43 Qf1961. 

(hereafter in this Chapter referred to as 
the Income-tax Act), in clause (15),-' 

(A) after sub-clause (iiia), the followingsubc 

-clause shan be inserted and shall be deemed to 
have been inserted with effect from theist day' of 
April, '2001,namely:-

"Uiib) interest payable to·the·.Nordfc 
Investment Bank, being a multilateral financial 
institution·constituted.by the Governments of 
Denmark"Finland, Iceland, Norway.,.and 
Sweden, on a loan advanced by it to a project 
approved 1::>y the Central Government in ·terms 
of .the Memorandum of Understanding entered 
into by the Central Government with that Bank 
on the 25th day of November, 1986;"; 

(B) in sub-clause (iv),-

(a) in item (c), the existing Explanation shall 
1::>e numbered as Explanation 1 thereof and· after 
Explanation 1 as so num1::>ered, the following 
Explanation shall 1::>e inserted and shall 1::>e 
deemed .to have 1::>een inserted with effect from 
the 1st day of April, 1962, namely:-



616 OFFICIAL GAZETTE - GOVT. OF GOA 
SERIES I No. 29 

"Explanation 2.-.For-the removal of doubts, 
it is hereby--declared that the usance interest 
payabie outside India by an undertaking 
engag",d. in,;the ,business. Of ship-breaking in 
respeGt of pUrchase' of a ship from outside India 
shall be deenled to be the Interest payable on a 
debt incurre.d in' a foreigr{ country iIi, respect of 

'" the pUrchase- outside India; ";- , 

(b) in the Explanation 1 occurring below item 
(i), after clause (d), the following. clause shall be 
inserted. and shall be deemed to have· been 
inseIted, with_ effec:t:from the. '1st. day of_April, 
1991, namely:-

"(da) the business of ship-breaking; or". , 

3. Insertion of new section lOBA.~ After section 
lOB of the Income-tax A~t, the follo~ng ~ection 
shall b~ inserted with eIfect from' the 1st day of 
April, 2004, namely:-

'10BASpeciali)1'0Visionsfu respect of export of 
certain articles or things.-(1) Subject to the 
provisions of this s'ection,'a deductiOn of such 
profits and gains as are derived by an undertaking 
from the export out of India of eligible articles or 
thingsj-.shall be. allowed from the total income of 
the assessee: . 

Provided'that wherein computing the total 
income of the undertaking, for any' ::;;,;sessment 
year, deduction under section lOA or sectien lOB­
has been claimed, the undertaking shall not be 
entitled to the deduction under this. section: 

Provided further that no,deduction under·this 
section shall be alloweq to any undertaking for the 
assessment year beginning on the 1st day of April, 
2010'ciJi!..d, subsequent years. 

, (2) This section applies to any undertaking 
which fulfils', the following conditions. namely:-

... (a) it manufactures or produces the ·-eligible 
articles or things without the use of im~ed 

; raw' materials;· 

(b) it is not formed by the splitting up, or the 
reconstruction, of a business already in 
existence: 

. Providedt1lat this condition shall not apply in 
respect o(ariyundertaking which is formed as 
a: result ofthE3 :re:establishmeIit, reconstruction 
orreviv<u by'thE38.sse$seeof the business of any 

14TH OCTOBER, 2004 

such undertaking as is 'rE3ferred to in section 33B, 
in the circumstances and- within the period 
specified in that section; 

(c)itis not foIllledby the transfer to a new 
business of machinery or plant previously used 
for any purpose. 

, ' 

'. Explanation.- The provisions of Explanation 
1 and Explanation-2to sub-section (2) of section 
80-Lshall apply for the purposes of this clause 
as they apply . for the purposes of clause (ii) of 
sub-section(2) of that section; , 

(d) ninety per cent. or more ofitssales during 
the previous year relevant to the assessment 
year are by way of exports oitheeligible articles 
or things; 

(e) it employs twenty Dr more workers during 
the previous year in the process of manufacture 
or production. 

(3) This section applies to the undertaking, if the 
sale proceeds of the eligible articles or things 
exported out of India are received in or. brought 
into, India by the assessee inconvertible foreign 
exchange, within a period. of six months from the 
end of the previous year or, within such further 
period as the comp",tent authority may allow in 
this behalf. 

'ExplaIiatioIi:- For the purposes of this sube 

-section, the.expression "competent authority" 
means the Reserve Bank of India or such other 
authority as is authorised. under any law for the 
time being iriforce for regUlating payments and 
dealings in foreign exchange .. 

(4) For the purposes of sub-section (1), the profits 
derived from export out of India of the eligible 
articles or things shall be the amount which bears 
to the profits of the business of the. undertaking, 
the same proportion as the .export turnover in 
respect of such articles or things bears to the total 
turnover of the business carried on by the 
undertaking. 

(5) The deduction under sub-section (1) shall not 
be admissible, unless the assessee furnishes in the 
prescribed form, along with the return of income, 
the· report .ofan accountant, as defined in the 
Explanation below sub-section (2) of section 288, 
certifying that the deduction has been correctly 
claim",tl in accordance with the provisions of this 
section. 



I 
i 

,I 

'I 1 

OFFIClALGAZETTE -GOVT. OF GOA 617 
14TH OCTOBER, 20M SERIES I No. 29 

(6) Notwithstandinganythingcontained.in any 
other provision of thisAct,wherea deducticm is 
allowed under this section in computing the total 
income'oftheassessee"no deductiOn,shall:be 
allowed under 'any other section in respect "of its 
export ,profits.-

(7) The provisions of sub-section (8) and sub­
-section (lD) of section 80-IAshall"so far as may 
be, apply in, relation to the undertaking referred to 
in this section as they apply for the, ,purposes of 
the undertaking .referred ,to in 'section 80,IA; 

Explanation,- 'For the purposes of this 
section,-

:(a) "convertible Joteignexchange", 
means hreign'exchange:whiphis:for" ' 
the time being treated,:bythe Re,serve 
Bank of India as convertible Joreign, :", 
exchange for the purposes of the 
Foreign Exchange Management, Act, 

',1999, and any rules made ,thereunder 42of1999. 

or,any other corresponding law for the 
time ,being in force; 

(b) "eligible ,articles or things n means all 
hand.made'articles ,or things" which are of 
artistic value and which requires the use of 
wood,as the'1llainrawmaterial; 

, (c) ",export turnover"meanstl1econsideration 
in respect of export by the undertaking of 
eligible articles or things received in, or brought 
into, India by the as::>e::>,::>ee,in convertible foreign 
exchange,in accordance 'with·sub-section,;( 3), 
but does not include freight, telecommunication 
chargeS or insurance attributable to the ,delivery 
of the, articles or thing::> outside India; 

'Cd)- ,i.export out of I~dia"shall not 
include anytransactio~by way of sale 
orotherwise,in a,shop, emporium or 
anY,other establishment situate in " " 
India, not involving clearance of,anY , 
customs ,station as, defined ,in th~ 
Customs Act, 1962.'. ' , ' 5~f1962. 

4. Amepdment of section 115P.- In section 115P 
of the' Income~tax Act,for the words "one and 
one-fourthpEircent;" ,the words "one per cent." 
shall' be ::>ub'stituted. 

5. Amendment of section 115S.- In section 115S 
of the ,Income~tax Act, for ,the words "one and 
one-fourth,percent." • ,the words, "one 'per, ,cent. " 
shall be substituted. 

6. Amendment of ::>ection 132B.- In section 132B 
of ;thelnco~e-taxAct, insub:s~ction(4), in 
clause. (al, for the words "eight per cent."" ,the 
words';si,x per cent. ",shaH be substituted. 

, 7. Amenclm~t of section158BFA.~ In sec~ion 
158BFA of the Income-tax Ast,in sub-section(l), 
for ,the words':one and one,fourth per cent,"" the 
words, "eme Per €ent;" , sl1all be substituted. 

8. Amendment of section 201.~ In section 201 
of the IncoIIle,taxAct, in sUb-section (lAi, for, the 
words "fifteen per cent. ", the words "twelve per 
cent." shall be substituted. 

, , , 

,9.Amendment ojs.e~tion206C.- In, section 
.206C of the Income-tax Act,-

(a) in sub-section,(l),-

'ii) for theT~le, thefollowiI;tgtabl~shall be 
, .sWJstituted, !lamely:~ '. . 

"TABLE 

Sl. No. Nature of goods Perqentage 

(1) (2) . (3) 

(i) 'Alcoholic liquor for human ' ,One,per cent. ,;' ' 
consumption 

(ii) Tendu leaves Five per cent, 

(iii) ,Timber obtained under a Two and one-half 
forest lease per cent. 

(iv) Timber obtained by any mode Two and one'half 
other than under a forest lease percent. 

('IT) Any othet'fbrest jlroduce not, Two and one,half 
,. being, timber or tendu leaves percent .. 

, (vi) Scrap One per cent. : "; 

(ti) for the proviso below the'llilile, the follOwing 
proviso shall be substituted, namely:-
.' , 

"Providedt):1at every person, being a seller 
shall at the time, during the period beginning 
on the 1st day of June, 2003 and ending on the 
day immediately preceding the date on which 
the Taxation Laws (Amendment) Act, 2003 
co~es into force, of debiting of ,the amount 
payable by the buyer to the account of the buyer 

. or of receipt, of such amount from the. said buyer 
in cash or by the issue of a cheque or draft or by 



618 
$jiF/I~i>INo: 29 . 

OFFIClI\L· GAZETTE ~ GOVT.· OF GOA 

:'lpd)tliermode, whichever is earlier, collect from 
,. tllehUyer of any goods of the nature specified in 
. ' . col YtM (2)0£ tlie'table as it stood immediately 

. p$>re the 1st day of June, 2003, a sum eqtial to 
the percentage, specifiedinthe corresponding 
em.!ytin colurtm(3) of the said 1able'of such 
aIilount as income-tax in aCcordance with the 
provisions of this· section as they stood 
immediatelybefore'the 1st day of Jurie, 2003."; 

(b) after SUb-section (1), the following sub­
~sections· shallbe'ihsert'ed, namely:'-· 

"(lA) Notwithstanding anYthing contained in 
sub-section (1), no collection of tax shall be made 

. in the case ora buyer, who is residentip. India, 
if such buyer fUrnishesto the person responsible 
for' collecting tax, a declaration in writing in 
duplicate in the prescribed form and verified in 
the prescribed manner to the effect that the 
goods referred to in column(2)oIthe aforesaid 
Table are to be utilised fcir the pUrposes of 
manufacturing, processing or producing articles 
or things and riot for trading purposes. 

(lE) The person reSponsible for' collectinJ tax 
under this section shall deliver or cause to. be 
delivered to the Chief Commissioner or 
Commissioner one copy.o(thedeclaration referred 
to in sub-section (1A) on or before the seventh day 
of the month next following the month in which 
the declaration is furnished to him."; 

. (c) in sub,section (3); for the words "seven 
days", the words "the prescribed time" shall be 
substituted; 

(d) in sub-section (5), for the words "ten days 
fro~ the· date of debit" , the words ..... such period as 
may be prescribed from the time of debit"· shall 
be substituted;"· . 

(e) in sub-section (7), for the words "one and 
one-fourth per cent.", the words "one per cent." 
shan be' substituted; '",- . .- . 

. ',. 
(f) in the Explanation occurring at the end, in 

. clause (a),for sub-clauses (i) and (ii), the following 
sub-claUses shall be substituted,· namely:-'-

..... (1) a public sectorcompaIi.y; the Central 
. "GovElinment, a State Government, and an 

embassy, a high commission, legation, 
Cominlss'fon, consulate and the trade 
represehtiitioIi.; of ·a foreign State and a club; 
or 

14TH OCTOBER, 2004 

(ii}a buyer in the retail sale of such goods 
.. purchaSed by him for: personal consumption;~' . 

10. Amendment of section220.~In section 220 
Of the·lncome-taxAct,insub-section (2),.for the 
words. "one and one-fourth per cent;", ,the words 
.. one per cent." shall be substituted. 

lhAmemdment of section230.'-In section 230 
. of the Income-tax Act, in sulY-section.(2), ,after the 
word, braCkets and figure "sub'section (1)";. the 
words, brackets, figure and letter. "or the first 
proviso to sub-section (lA)" shall be inserted and 
shall be deemed to have been inserted with effect 
from the 1st day of June, 2003 . 

12. Amendment of section 234A:-In section 
234A of the Income-taX Act, insub'sections (1) and 
(3), for the words "one·and . one-fourth per . cent. ", 
the words ','one per cent." shall be substituted. 

13. Amendment of' section 234B.""':' In section 
234B of the Income~taxAct, in sub-sections (1), and 
(3), for the words "one and one-fourtliper cent.", 
the words "one per· cent." shall be substituted. 

14. Amendment of section 234C.- In section 
234C of the Income-tax Act, in sub-section (1),-

(i) in clause (a), in sub-dauses(i) and (ii), for 
the words "one and one-fourth per cent.", the 
words "one per cent." shall be substituted; 

(ii) in clause (b), jn sub-clauses (i) and (ii), for 
the words "one and one-fourtli·per cent.", the 
words "one per c·ent." shall be substituted; 

15. Amendment of section 234D.~ .In section 
234D of the Income-tax Act, in sub-section (1), . for 
the words "two-third per cent.", the words "one­
half per cent." sh-all be substituted. 

16. Amendment of section 244A.- In section 
244A of the Income-tax Act, in sub-section (1), in 
clauses (a) and (b); for the words "two-third per 
cent.", the words "one-half per·cent."shall be 
substituted . 

17. Amendment of section 272A.- In section 
272A of the Income-tax Act, in sub-section C2), 
after clause (i), the following clause shall be 
inserted, namely:-

.. U} to deliver or clause to be delivered in due 
.. time a copy ofthe declaration referred to in sub­

-section (lA) of section 206C,". 



OFFICIAL GAZETTE .:..- GOVT. OF GOA 619 
SERIES I N.D. 29 14TH OCTOBER,2004 

18. Amendment of second ScheduIe.- In Second Notification 
Schedule to the Income-tax Act, in rule 68A, in 
sub~ruIe (3), for the words "eight per cent.", the 
words "six per cent." shall be substituted. 

CHAPTER III 

Amendments to the Wealth-Tax Act, 1957., 

19. Amendment oisection 17B.- In 
section 17B of the Wealth-tax Act, 1957 270f1957. 

(hereafter in this Chapter referred to as 
the Wealth-tax Act), in sub-sections (1) 
and (3), for the words "one and one-
-fourth per cent.", the words "one per 
cent." shall be substituted. 

20; Amendment of section 31.- In section 31 of 
the Wealth-tax Act, in sub-section (2),-

(a) for the words "oue and one-fourth per 
cent.", the words "one per cent." shall be 
substituted; 

(b) in the second proviso, for the words "one 
and one-fourth per, cent.", the ,words "one per 
cent." shalI.be substituted. 

21. Amendment of section 34A.~ In section 34A 
of the W",alth-tax Act,-

(a) in sub-section (3), for the words "eight per 
cent.", the words "six'per cent." shall be 
substituted; 

(b) in sub-section (4B), in clause (a), for the 
words "two-third per cent.", the words "one­
-half per cent." shall be substituted. 

CHAPTER IV 

Amendments to the Expem;liture-Tax Act, 1987 
.--... 
22. Amendment of section 14 of Act 35 of 1987.-

In section 14 of the'Expenditure-tax Act, 1987, for 
the words :'one ,and one-fourth per cent.", the 
words "one per cent." shall be substituted. 

23. Repeal and saving.- (1) The 
Taxation Laws (Amendment) Ordinance, 
2003 is hereby repealed. 

(2) Notwithstanding such repeal, 
anything done or any action taken under 

"-
~ 
,~ 

Ord.2 
of2003. 

the Income-taxAct,1961, the Wealth-tax 43 of 1961. 

Act, 1957 and the Expenditure-tax Act, 27 of 1957. 

1987, as amended by the said Ordinance, 35 of 1987. 

shall be deemed to have been done 
or taken under the corresponding 
provisions of those Acts, as amended by 
this Act., 

10/3/2003-LA (Part) 

The Prevention of Terrorism (Repeal) 
Ordinance, 2004 (Ordinance No.1 of 2004), which 
has been promulgated by the President in the 
fifty-fifth Year of the Republic ofIndia and published 
in the Gazette of India, Extraordinary, Part II, 
Section 1, No. 30 dated 21-9-2004,. is hereby 
published for general information of the public. 

S. G. Marathe, Under Secretary (Drafting). 

Panaji, 4th October, 2004. 

MINISTRY OF LAW AND JUSTICE, 

(Legislative Department) 

New Delhi, dated the 21st September, 2004/ 
/Bhadra 30, 1926 (Saka) 

The Prevention of Terrorism (Repeal) Ordinance, 2004 

No.1 of 2004 

Promulgated by the President in the Fifty-fifth 
Year of the Republic of India, 

An Ordinance to repeal the Prevention of 
Terrorism Act, 2002. 

Whereas Parliament is not in session' and the . . 
President is satisfied that circumstances exist 
which render it necessary for him to take, 
immediate action; 

'Now, therefore, in exercise of the powers 
conferred by clause (1) of article 123 Of the 
Constitution, the President is pleased to promulgate 
the following Ordinance:-

1. Short title and commencement.- (ll. This 
Ordinance may be called the Prevention of 
Terrorism (Repeal) Ordinance, 2004.' 

(2) It shall come into force at once. 

2. Repeal and saving, etc.- (1) The 
Prevention of Terrorism Act, 2002 is 15 of 2002. 

hereby repealed. 

(2) The repeal of the said Act shall not affect-' 

(a) the previous operation of, or anything duly 
done or suffered under, the said Act, or 



II 

620 OFFICIAL GAZETTE - GO)lT. OF GOA 
SEFUES. I No. 29 

(b) any right, pJjvilege or.ol;>ligation or liability 
acquired, accrued or incurred under the said 
Act, or 

. . (c) any penalty, forfeiture or punishment 
.incurred in respect of anyoffenceunder the said 
Act, or 

(d) any investigation,legal proceeding or 
remedy in respect of any such rig'ht, privilege, 
obligation, 'liability, penalty, forfeiture or 
punishment as aforesaid, 

and, any such investigation, legal proceeding 
or remedy may be instituted,. continued or 
enforced and any such penalloy, forfeiture' or . 
punishment may be imposed as if the said Act 
had not been repealed: 

Provided' that' notwithstanding anything 
contained in .this. sUb-section or-in any other law 
for the time being in force, no court shall take 
cognizance oCan.offence under the repealed Act 
after the expiry·oUhe'period of one year from the 
commencement of this Ordinance. 

(3) Notwithstanding the repeal of section 60 of 
the said Act, the Review Committee constituted 
by the. Central Government under sub-section (1) 
of that"section,whether or not an application 
under sub-sectioIi(4) of that 'section has been 
made, shall review all cases registered under that 
Act as to 'whether there is· a prime· facie case for 
proceeding against the accused thBr0mtderand 
such review shall be completed within a ;;~Yi()d 
oione year from the commencement of this 
Ordinance and where the Review Committee is of 
the·opinion that there is no "prima facie case for 
proceeding against the accused, then,-

. ., (a:r incases in, which cognizance has been 
takenbyth~ .. coUrt,the ,cases shallbedeemed 
to have been lNithdravm:.and . .. . 
'. "_. - -',' ,.oj - • 

(b) in cases in Which'investigatioIis are 
pending, the investigations shall be. closed 
fort~With; ". '. ..... '.' ..... ..' .""~,~ 

with effect.trom the .dateofissuance·ofthe 
direction by such Review Committee ill this 
regard. 

(4) The Review Committee constituted 
by the Ceni'r<il Government under sUb-
-sectioll (1 )~f sEl~tion60 of the said Act 
shall, while reviewing cases, have 
powers.of a civil court under the Code of 
CivilProceciure, 1908.inrespect of the5of)908. 
fOlloWingrnatters, nameh~: .. 

14TH OCTOBER, 2004 

. (a) di",covery and pr()duction ()f any document; 

(b) requisitioning any public record orcoj)Y 
thereoffrom any court or office. , -, - , . 

(5) The Central Government may constitute 
more Review Committees, as it may consider 
necessary, for completing the review within the 
period specified in sub-section (3). 

A. P. J. ABDUL KALAM; 
·President. 

T. K.VISWANATHAN, 
Secy. to the Govt.o! India. 

Notification 

10/3/2003-LA (Part) 

The' Unlawful Activities' (Prevention) 
Amendment Ordinance, 2004 (Ordinance No. 2 
of 2004), which has been j)romulgated by the 
President in the Fifty-fiftll Year' of the Republic 
of India and published in the GazetteofIridi~, 
Extraordinary, Part II, Section 1, No. 31 dated 
21-9-2004, . is' hereby published for general 
information of the public. 

S. C. Marathe, UilderSecretary (Drafting). 

Panaji, 4th October, 2004; 

MINISTRY OF1.AW AND JUSTICE 

(Legislative Department) 

New Delhi, dated the 21st September; 2004/" . 
jBhadra30, 1926 (Saka) 

The Unlawfui Activities \Prevention) Amendm'ent 
Ordinance" 2004 

No.2 of 2004 

Promulgated by the President in the Fifty'fifth 
Year of the Republic of India. 

. Ar)Ordinance further' to amend the· Unlawful 
Activities (Prevention) Act, 1967. 

Whereas Parliament is not in session and the 
President is satisfied that circumstances exist· 



I 
:1 

,-' -----

OFFICIAL GAZETTE - CWVT. OF GOA '621 
14THOCTOBE1'I., 2004 , SERIES I No. 29' 

which render 'it necessary for him to take 
immediate action; 

Now, therefore, in exercise of'the' p()wers 
conferred by clause (1) of article 123 of the 
Constitution, the'Presidentis pleasedtopromulgate 
the following 'Ordinance:-

1.-Short title and, commencement.- This 
Ordinance may be called the Unlawful Activities 
(Prevention) Amendment Ordinance, 2004. 

(2) It'shall come into force at once. 

'2. Amendmerit'oflonfrtitle.~Inthe 
Unlawful Activities (Prevention) Act, 
1967 (hereinafter referred to as the 37 of 1967. 
principal Act), in the longtiile,afteiihe 
wqrd'-;"!associations-" ,,- 'the- weirds' .'Ii ,and-' 
for dealing with'terroristactivities," shall' 
be ,inserted. 

3, ''Substitution of word "Code "for '''Code of 
Crlminru Fr6ceCIilre;1898'~- IntheprtncipalAct, 
fOI'the words and figures "Code c)f Criminal 
Procedure, 1898", wherevert!leydccur, thew-ord 
"Code" shall be substituted. 

4. AmElndment of Chapter 1.- In Chapter I of 
theprineipal Act, for sections 1, 2 and 2A, the 
following sections shall be substituted;,namely:-

'LShon ,title, extent andapplication.~ (1) This 
Act may be,called the Unlawful Activities 
(Prevention) Act, 1967., 

(2) It extends to the wholebflndia, 

(3) Every person shall be liable to punishment 
under this Act forevery,act or omission contrary 
to tfie pr9,visions thereof, of which he is: held guilty 
in India. 

, ' 

(4) Any persol'l: who qOmmitS'>Il 0ffElncebeyond 
India, which is punishable under this Act,shall be 
~ealt with according to th~ prOviSion8'~hiS Act 
In the same manner as if sup!), act ha(.,been 
committed :,in melia.', 

(S)Tlie provisionsc)f this Act apply also to"­

(a) citizens' oOndia outside India; 

(b) persons in the, s,erviceof the Government, 
wherever they may be; and 

(c) persons on ships and aircrafts, registered 
. in India, wherever they may be. 

2' Definitions.-(1) In this Act; unless the 
context oth.,rwise requires,-

(a) "association" means any cOlilbtdationor 
body of mdividuals; 

, (b)"cession of a part of the territory of'lnciia" 
includes admission ofthe clqimbf any foreign 
country to any such part; 

(c) "Code" means the Code of 
CriminaLProcedure, 1973;2011974. 

(d) "court" means a criminal court having 
jurisdiction, under the Code, to try offences 
under, this Act; 

, (e) "Designated Authority" means such officer 
·,',of the Celltral G6vemrrientnot below the rank 

of Joint Secretary to that Govemrrient, o~ such 
officer of the State' Government not below the 
rank of Secretary to that Gc)vernment,as the 
case may be" as may be specified by the Central 
Governmen~ or the State Gove~nment, by a 
notification published in the Official Gazette; 

(il' "presc;ibed" means prescribed by rules 
made und~r this Act;; , . 

, , ' 

(g) "proceeds of terrorisIn" means an kinds 
of properties which have been derived or 
obtained from commission of,imy terrorist act or 
have been ,acquired through funds traceable to 
a terrorist act, irrespective of person in whose 
name such proceeds are standing or in, whose 
possession they ,aie found, and, includs any 
property which is being'used, oris intended to 

. :be used, for the' purPO$,fj of a ter).'orist 
organisation; 

' .... (h) i'property" means property and assets of 
every description, whether corporeal or 

, incorporeal, movable or immovable, tangible or 
int'angible and deeds and instruments 
evidencing title to, or inter.est in, such 
property or assets, and includes cash andbahk 
account; 

(i) "secession of a part of the territory of India 
from the Union'" includes the assertion of any 
claim to determine whether such part will 
remain a part of the territory of India; 

Ul "StateGovemment", in relation to a Union 
terri'tory, means the Administrator thereof; 



622 OFFICIAL GAZETTE - GOVT. OF GOA 
SERIES I No. 29 

(k) i'terrorist act" has the meaniIlg assigned 
to "it in section 15, and the expressions 
"terrorism" and "terrorist" shall be construed 
accordingly; 

(1) "terrorist gang" means any association, 
other than terrorist organisation, whether 
systematic or otherwise, which is concerned 

. with,or irivolved iri, terrorist act;· 

(m) "terrorist organisation" means an 
organisation listed in the Schedule or an 
organisation operating under the same name as 
an organisation so listed; 

(n) "Tribunal" means the Tribunal constituted 
under section 5; 

(0) "unlawful activity", in relation to an 
individual.orassociation, means anyaction·taken 
by such individual or association (whether 
by committing an act or by words·, either 
spol\:en or written, or by signs or by visible 
representation orotherwise),-

(i) which is ~terid~d, or supports any claim, 
to bring· about, on ariy ground whatsoever, 
the cession of a part of the territory of India or 
the secession of a part ofthe territory ofIndia 
from the Union, or which incites any individual 
or group of individuals to bring about such 
cession :6r"'secession; or 

(ii) .which gis.claims,questions, disrupts or 
is. intendedto·di~rupt the. sovereignty and 
territorial integrity of Illdia; or 

".:. (iii) which causes 'or'is intended to cause 
disaffection against India; 

(p)·,"unlawf!ll association" means· any 
association,-'-

(t) w!lich has for its object any unlawful 
actlvit\r;otwnich encoilrages or aids persons 
to undertake anyilrilawfuJ. activity, or of which 

. the membersunde~takeSJich activity; or 

. (ii) which has for its object any 
activity which is punishable under 
section 153A or section 153B of the 
Indian Penal Code, or which 45011860. 

·encouragesor aids persons to 
.:. under.take. any such: activity, or of 

.. which the. members undertake any 
such activity: 

Provided that nothing contained in sUb-clause 
(ii) shall apply to the State of Jammu and Kashmir; 

14TH OCTOBER, 2004 

(q) words and expressions used but .not 
defined in this Act and defined in the. Code shall 
have the meanings. respectively assigned to 
them in the Code. 

. (2) Any reference in this Act to any enactment 
or any proviSion thereof shall, in relation to an area 
in which such enactment or such provision is not 
in force, b.econstrued as .a reference to the 
corresponding law or the relevant provision onhe 
corresponding law, if any, in force in that area.'. 

5. Amendment of se(':tion. 5.- In section 5 of the 
principal Act in sub-section (7), for the word and 
figures "qhapter XXXV", the word and figures 
"Chapter XXVI" shall be substituted. 

6. Substitution of new section for section 10.­
For section 10 of the principal Act, the following 
section shall be sUbstituted, namely:-

"10. Penalty for being member of an urilawful 
association, etc.~ Where an .association is 
declared urilawful by a notification issued under 
. section 3which has become effective under 
sUb-se·ction (3) of that section,-

(a) a person, who-

. (i) is and continues to be a member of 
such associatioIl; or 

(ii) takes part in meetings of such 
association; ,or· 

(iii) contributes to, or receives or solicits 
any contribution for the purpose of, such 
association; or 

(iv) in any way assists the operations of 
such association, 

shall be punishable with imprisonment for a 
term whiCh may extend to two years, and shall 
also be liable to fine; and 

(b) a person, who is or continues to be a member 
of such association, or voluntarily does an act 
aiding or promoting in any marmer the objects of 
such association and in either case is in possession 
of any unlicensed frrearms, .. ammunition, explosive 
or other· instrument or substance capable of 
causing mass destruction and ·commitsany act 
resulting in loss of human life or grievous injury to 
any person or causes significant damage to any 
property,-



OFFICIAL GAZETTE - GOVT. OF GOA 623 
14TH OCTOBER, 2004 SERIES I No. 29 

(i) and if such act has resulted in the death of 
any person, shall be punishable with death. or 
imprisonment for life and shall also be liable to 
fine; 

(ll)in any othe~ case, shan be punishable with 
imprisonment for a term which shall not be less 
than five years but which may extend to 
imprisonment for life, and shall also be liable to 
fine.", 

7. Substitution of new Chapters and Schedule 
for Chapter JV.- For Chapter IV of the IJrinOipal 
Act, the following Chapters and the Schedule shall 
be substituted,namely:-, . 

~ - ----

:CHAPTER IV. 

, Punishment for Terrorist Activities' 

15., Terroristact.- Whoever, with intent to 
threaten the unity, integrity, security or sovereignty 
of India ,or to strike terror in the people or any 
section of the people in India or in any foreign 
country, does any aot by using bombs, dynamite 
or other explosive substances or inflammable 
substances or firearms or other lethal weapons Or 
poisons' or noxious gases or other chemicals or by 
any other substances (whether biological or 
otherwise) of a hazardous nature, in such a manner 
as to cause,or likely,to cause, death of, or injuries 
to any person or Persons or loss of, or damage to, 
or destruction of"property or disruption of any 
supplies or services essential to the life of the 
community in,India,or..in any foreign country or 
causes damage or destruction of any property or 
equipment ,used or intended to Qe used for the 
defence of India or in,connection with any other 
Purpo1;eS of the Government of India, any State 
Government or any of their agencies, or detains 
any person and threatens to kill or injure such 
person--in order to compel the Government in India 
or the Govefnme.nt of a foreign country or any, 
other person to do 'or abstain from doing any act, 
commits a terrorist act. 

16. Punishment for terrorist act.- (1) Whoever 
commits a terrorist act shall,- "-.... -

(a) if such act has resulted in the death of 
any person, he, punishable with death or 
imprisonment for life, and shall also be, liable to 
fine; 

(b) in any other case, be punishable with 
imprisonment for a term which shall not be less 
than five years but which may extend to 

---'-"-' 

imprisonment for life, and shall also be liable to 
fine. 

,17. Punishment for raising fund for terrorist 
act.- Whoever rais,es fund for the purpose of 
committing a terrorist act shall be punishable with 
imprisonment for ,a term, which shall not be less 
than five years but which may extend, to 
imprisonment for life, and' shall also be liable to 
fine. 

:.18. Punishment ,for conspiracy, etc.- Whoever 
conspires or attempts to commit,or advocates, 
abets, advises or incites or knowingly facilitates 
the commission of, a terrorist act or 'any act 
preparatory to the commission of a terrorist act, 
shall be punishable with imprisonment for a term 
which shall not be less than five years but which 
may extend to imprisonment for life, and shall also 
be liable to fine. 

19. Punishment for harbouring, ,etc.- Whoever 
voluntarily harbours or conceals, .or attempts to 
harbour or conceal any person knowing that such 
person is a terrorist shall be punishable with 
imprisonment for a term which shall not be less 
than three years but which may extend, to 
imprisonment for life, and shall also be liable to 
fine: 

Provided that this section shall not apply to any 
case in which the harbour or concealment. is by 
the spouse of the offender. 

20. Punishment for being member of terrorist 
gang or organisation.- Any person who is a 
member of a terrorist gang or a terrorist 
orgarusation, which is involved in terrorist act, shall 
be punishable with imprisonment for a term which 
may extend to imprisonment for life, and shall also 
be liable to fine. 

21. Punishment for holdingproceeqsof 
terrorism.- Whoever knowingly holds any 
property derived or obtained from commission of 
any terrorist act or acquired through the terrorist 
fund shall be punishable with imprisonment for a 
term which may extend to imprisonment for life, 
and shall also be liable to fine. 

.22. Punishment for. threatening witness.-, 
Whoever threatens <lny person who isa witness 
or any other person in .whom such witness may 
be interested, with violence, or wrongfully 
restrains or confines. the witness, or any other 
person in whom the witness may be interested, or 



624 
SERIES/No. 29 

OFFICIAL GAZETTE - GOVT. OF GOA 

does any other unlawful act with intent to cause 
. any of the said acts, shall be punishable with 

imprisonment which may extend to ,three years, 
and shall also be liable to fine. 

23. Enhanced penalties.~ (1) If any 
person' wIth intent to aid any terrorist 
contravenes anY-provision of,or any rule 
made under the Explosives Act, 1884 or 4011884. 

the Explosive Substances Act, 1908 or the 6011908. 

Inflaminable Substances Act, 1952 or the 20011952. 

Arms'Act, 1959,or'is in unauthorised 54011959. 

posse~sion. of any'bomb,dynamite>or 
hazardous explosive substance or other 
lethal Weapon or substance' capable of 
mass destruCtion of biological or 
chemical substance of wanare, he shall, 
notwithstanding anything contained in 
any of the aforesaid, Acts or the rules 
made thereunder, be punishable with 
imprisonment for a term whichshall'not . 
be less than five years but which may 
extend to imprisonment for life,' artdshall· 
also be liable to fine. 

(2) Any person who, with intent to aid any 
terrorist, attempts to contravene or'abets, or does 
any act preparatory to contravention of any 
provision of any law or rule specified in sub-section 
(1); shall be deemed to have contravimed . that 
Rrovisionunder sUb-section (1) and the provisions 
of that sub-section in relation to such person, have 
effect subject to the modification that the reference 
to "imprisonment ,for life" therein shall be 
construed as··a ·reference' to "iinpiisonmEmt for 
ten,years" ." 

CHAPTER V 

- ~orteiture of Proceeds of Terrorism . 

24. Forfeiture of.proceeds ofteri(')tism.~(l) 'No 
personshallr hbld 'or be'in 'possession6f 'any 
proceeds, of terrorism. 

.''''' 
,(2) Proceeds of. terrorism,whether hend 'by. a 

terrorist or·bY any other person and whether ot 
not such terrorist or other person is prosecuted or 
convicted for any offence under Chapter IV or 
Chapter VI; shall be ,liable to be' forfeited to the 
Central'Governmen.torthe State Government,aS 
the case may be, in the 'manner provided under 
thi'sChapter. 

'25. Powers of investigating officer and . 
Designated Authority and appeal against order of 

,14TH OCTOBER, 2004 

Designated Authoritjr.- (1) If' an officer 
investigating an offence committed under Chapter 
IV or Chapter VI, has reason to believe thatimy 
property in relation to which an investigation is 
beingcon'aucted, represents proceeds of 
tetr6rism, he shall, with the ririorappiovalin 
writing of the Director General oithe Police of the 
State in which such property issitu?ied, make an 
order seizing such property and where it isnot 
practicable to seize such property, make an order 
of attachment directing that such property shall 
not be' trartsferredor otherwise dealt with except 
Withthe prior permission of the officer makiIlg such 
order, or of the Designated Authority before whom 
the property seized or attached is produced and a 
copy of such order sh;':l1be- served on the person 
concerned. 

(2) The investigating officer shall duly inform the 
Designated Authority within forty~eight hours of 
the seizure' or ,attacpment . of suC:hproperty. 

. (3) The Designated Authority before whom the 
seized or attached property is produced· shall 
either' confirm' or revoke the order of seizure. or 
attachment so issued within a period of sixty days 
from the date of such production: 

Provided that·an opportunity of making a 
representation by the person whose property is 
being seized or attached shall be given. 

(4) In the case of immovable property attached 
by the investigating officer, it shall be deemed to 
have been produced before the Designated 
Authority; wilen the investigating officer notifies 
his report andrilaces it at the disposal of the, 
Designated Authority. 

(5) The investigating officer may seize and detain 
any cash to which this Chapter applies if he has 
reasonable grounds for suspecting that--

(a) it is intended to be used for the purposes 
of terrorism; or 

(b) it forms the whole or part of the resources 
of a terrorist organisation: . 

Provided that the cash seized under this sub­
-section: by the investigating officer shall be 
released within a period of forty-eight hours 
beginning with the time when it is seized unless 
the matter involving the cash is before the 
Designated Autl,ority and such Authority passes 
an order allowing its retention beyond forty-eight 
hours,. 



! 
" 

OFFICIAL GAZETTE - GOVT. OF GOA. 625 
14TH OCTOBER, 2004 SERIES T No., 29 

Explanation.-·Fo.r the .purp.oses. o.f this sub­
-section, "cash'~ means-, 

. (a) co.ins()rno.tesinailycurrenc~; 
(b) po.sta,l.orders; 

(c) traveller's cheques; 

(d) banker's drafts; and 

(e) such o.ther mo.netary instruments ,as the 
Central Go.vernment o.r, as the case maybe, the 
State Go.vernment may specify by an o.rdermade 
in writing. 

(6) Any perso.n aggrieved by an orcter made by 
the Designated Autho.rity may prefer an appeal to. 
the co.urt within a period o.f thirty days fro.m the 
date o.f receipt o.f the order, and the court 'may' 
either confirm the o.rder o.f attachment o.f property 
o.r seizure so. made o.r revo.ke such o.rderand release 
the property. 

26. Court to order forfeiture of p[oc.eedsof 
terrorism.-·Where any pr~perty is' seized o.r 
attached o.n the'ground.that it co.nstitutes proceeds 
o.f terrorism and the co.urt co.nfirms the o.rder in 
this regard under sub-sectio.n (6) o.f sectio.n 25, it 
maymder·fo.rfeiture o.f such property, whether o.r 
no.t. the p",rso.n fro.m who.se possession it.is seized 
o.r. attached, is .prosecuted in a co.urt fo.r an o.ffence 
'under Chapter Nor Chapter VI. 

27. Issue o.fsho.w cause notice b.efore .fo.rfeiture 
o.f proceeds of terrorism.- (1) No. o.rder fo.rfeiting 
any proceeds o.f terro.rism shall b", made u~der 
sectio.n 26 unless the perso.n ho.ldirig o.r in 
po.ssessio.n of such proceeds is given a' no.tice in 
writing irifo.rminghimo.fthe grounds o.n which it 
is propo.sed to. fo.rfeit the pro.ceeds o.f terro.rism and 
such per~oriis given. an. o.ppo.rtunityo.f making a 
repr;"sentatii:m. iJ.l writlllg within suchieaso.nable 
time ~s nia,ybespecified in theno.tice against the. 
grounds o.f fo.rfeiture and i's also' given a. rea.sOna.ble 
o.pporttmityo.f beinghear(i in the matter", 

. .'\.~ 

(2) No order o.f fo.rfeiture shallbe rnadeunder 
sub,sectio.n(1), jf suchperso.n.esta.blishes thath", 
is a bona fide transferee ()f such pro.ceeds fo.r value 
witho.utkn()wingthat they represent proceedso.f 
terrorism. 

(3) It shall be .co.mpetent .fo.r the co.urt to. make 
an o.rderin respect o.f.the property seized o.r 
attached,7- . • 

(a) directing it to. be so.ld if it is aperisha.ble 
property and the provisio.ns o.f sectio.n 459.·o.f the· . 

Co.de shall, as nearly·as may be practicable, 
apply to. the net ;proceeds o.f such sale; 

(b) no.minating a~yo.fficer. o.f the Central 
Go.;'ernrnent o.r the State Go.vernment, in the' 
case o.f any o.ther property, to. perfo.rm the 
functio.n o.f the. administrato.r o.f such property 
subject to. such co.pditio.nsas may be specified 
by the Co.urt. 

28. Appeal.- (1) Anyperso.n aggrieved by an 
o.rder ()f fo.rfeiture under sectio.n 26 may, within one . 
mo.nth fro.m the da:te o.f the receipto.f such o.rder, 
appeal to. the High Co.urt within who.se jUrisdictioIl, 
the co.urt, which passed the o.rder appealed 
against, is situated. . 

(2)Where an o.rder under sectio.n 26 is mo.dified 
o.r annulled by the High Co.urt. o.r where in a 
prosecutio.n inst~tuted fo.r a.nyoffence under 
Cha.pter IV o.r Chapter VI,the·perso.n a.gainst who.m 
an order offo.rf~iture has been madeundeisectio.n 
26 is acquitted, such pro.perty shall be returned to . 
hfrnand in either case if it is not possible for any 
reaso.n to. return the forfeited property, such perso.n 
shall be paid the price therefo.r as ifthe property 
had been so.ld to. the Central Go.vernment with 
reaso.nable interest calculated from the. day ~f • 
seizure of th.e property. and such price shall be. 
determined in the maimer prescrib",d. . 

29. Order of forei~ure not to interfere with other 
punishments.-The o.rder o.f fo.rfeiture made under 
this Chapter by the court, shall no.t preveIlt the 
infliction of any o.ther punishment to which the 
person affected thereby is liable under Chapter IV 
or Chapter VI. 

30. Claims by third party.- (1) Where any claim 
is preferred or any objection is made to the seizure . 
or attachment of any property under section 250.n 
the ground tha.t.·such .property is not liable to 
seizure or attachment, the Designated Autho.rity 
befo.re whom such property is produced; shall . 
pro.ceed to. investigate the claim or o.bjectio.n: 

Provided that no suchinvestigiitio.n shall be 
made where the Designated Autho.rity c;onsiders 
that the claim or objection is designed to. cause 
unnecessary delay .. 

(2) Where an appeal ha~ been preferred under . 
SUb-section (6) o.f section 25 and any claimant or 
objector·esta.blishesthat the property specified in 
the no.tice issued under section 27 is no.t lia.bleto 
be fo.rfeited under this Chapter, the said no.tice shall 
be withdrawn or mo.dified ;accordingly. 



626 OFFICIAL GAZETTE - GOVT. OF GOA 
SERIES I No. 29 

31. Powers of Designated Authority.- The 
Designated Authority,' acting under the provisions 
of this Chapter, shall have all the powers of a civil 
court required for making a, full and fair' inquiry 
into the matter before it. 

32. Certain transfers to be null and void.­
Where; after the issue of an order under section 
25 or issue of a notice under section 27, any 
property referredto in the said order or notice is 
transferred by any mode whatsoever, suchtransfer 
shall, for the purpose of the proceedings under 
this Chapter, be ignored and if such property is 
subsequently forfeited, the transfer of such 
property shall be deemed to be null and void. 

33. Forfeiture of property of certain persons.­
(1) Where any person is accused of an offence, 
under Chapter IV o~ Chapter VI, it shall be open to 
the court to pass an order that all or any of the ,. . 
properties, movable or immovable or both, 
belonging to him, shall, during the period of such 
trial, be attached, if not alr",ady attached, under 
this Chapter. 

(2) Where a person has been convicted of any 
offence punishable under Chapter IV or Chapter 
VI, the cdurt may, in addition tci awarding any 
punishment, by order in writing, declare that any 
property, movable or immovable or both, belonging 
to the accused and specified in the order, shall 
stand forfeited to the Central Government or the 
State Government; as the case may be, free from 
all encumbrances. 

34. Company to transfer shares to 
Government.- Where any share in a 
company stands forfeited to the Central 
Government or the State Government, as 
the cas.;may be, under this Chapter, then, 
the compa,ny shan, con receipt of the order 
ofthe court, notwithstanding anything 
contained in the Companies Act, 1956, or 
the articles of association of the com­
pany, forthwitl;J. register the Central 
Government or the State Government, 
as the case maybe, as the transferee of 
such share. 

CHAPTER VI 

Terrorist Organisations 

1 of 1956. 

·35 .. Amendment of Schedule, etc.- (1) The 
Central ,Government may, by order, in the· Official 
Gazette,-

(a) add an organisation in the Schedule; 

14TH OCTOBER, 2004 

(b) add also an organisation in the Schedule, 
which is identified as a terrorist organisation in 

-a resolution adopted by the Security Council 
under Chapter VII of the Charter of the United 
Nations, to combat international terrorism; 

(c) remove an organisation from the Schedule; 

. (d) amend the Schedule in some other way. 

(2) The Central Government shall exercise its 
power under clause (a) cif sub-section (1) in respect 
of an organisation only if it believes that it is 
involved in terrorism. 

(3) For the purposes of sub-section (2), an 
organisation shall be deemed to be involved in 
terrorism if it-

(a) commits or participates in acts of terrorism, 
or 

(b) prepares for terrorism, or 

(c) promotes or encourages terrorism, or 

(d) is otherwise involved in terrorism. 

36. Denotification of a terrorist orgariaisation.- ' 
(1) An application may be made to the Central 
Government for the exercise of its power under 
clause (c) of SUb-section (1) of section 35 to remove 
an organisation from the Schedule. 

(2) An application under sub-section (1) may be 
made by-

(a) the organisation, or 

(b) any person affected by inclusion of the 
organisation ·in the Schedule as a terrorist 
organisation. 

(3) The C'entral Government may prescribe the 
procedure for admission and disposal of an 
application made under this sectioI\. 

(4) Where an application under sub-section (1) 
has been rejected, the applicant may apply for a 
review to the Review Committee constituted by 
the Central Government under sub-section (1) of 
section 37, within one month from'the date of 
receipt of the order of such rejection by the 
applicant. 

(5) The Review Committee may allow an 
application for review against rejection to remove 
an organisation from the Schedule, if it considers 
that the decision to reject was flawed when 
considered in the light of the principles applicable 
on an application for judicial review. 



OFFICIAL GAZETTE - GOVT. OF GOA 627 
14TH OCTOBER, 2004 SERIES! No. 29 . 

. (6) Where the Review Committee allows review 
under .sub-section( 5) by orin respect· of an 
organisation,' itrnaymake an order to such effect. 

(7) Where an order is made under sub-section 
(6), the Central Governineht shall,assoon as the 
certified copy of the order is received by it,ma:ke 
an order removing the organisation from the 
Schedule .. 

37. Review Gommittees.- (1) The Central 
Government shall constitute one or more Review 
Committees for the purposes of section 36: 

(2) . Every such Co~rnittee shall consist of a 
Chairperson and such other members not 
exceeding three.' arid possess'irrgsue:h 
quatilidations.as niay be prescribed. 

(3) A ChairpersOn of the Committee shall bea 
'person ~ho is, or has been, a Judge of a: High 
Court, who shall be appointed by tl;le c'entral 
Government and in the case of appointment of 
a sittirig Judge, the cbn6drrellce' ofihe Chief 
Justice of the concerned . High Court shall be 
obtained. 

38. Offence. relating to membership of a 
terrorist organisati'On.- (1) A person, who 
associates himself, or'professes t'O be associated, 
with a terrorist organisation with intention to 
further itsadtivities, c:orninitsarr otfencerelating 
to mefubership of a terrorist . organisation: . 

Provided that this SUb-section sha:n not apply 
where the person charQed is able to prove-

(a) that theorgarusationwas not declared as 
a terrorist organisation at the time .when he 
became a: 'member or began to profess to be a 
mEimber; ~nd 

(b) that heha~ not taken part iri the activities 
of the organisation at any tiIlle during. its 
inclusion in the Schedule as a terrorist 
organisation .. 

,,~ 

. " .'. . .' . . "l. 
(2) A person, who commits the' offence relating 

to membership of a: terrorist oT\Janisationunder 
sub-section' (1 r. . shall be punishable" with 
imprisonment for a term not exceeding ten years, 
or with fine, or with both. 

39. Offence relating to SUpp'Ort given to a 
terrorist organisation.- (1) A person commits the 
offence relating to support given' to a terrorist 
organisation,c:::. 

· (a) who, with .intention to. further the activity 
of a terrorist organisation,-7' 

(i) invites support for the terrorist 
organisation, and 

(il) the support is not or is not restricted to 
provide. money or othe.r.property within the 

· meaning of section 40; or 

(b) who, with intention to further the activity 
of a terrorist organisation, arranges, manages 
or assists in arranging or managing a meeting 
which he knows is-

(i) to support the terrorist organisation, or 

(ii) to further the' activity of the terrorist 
· organisation,-or 

(iii) to be addressed by a person who 
associates or professes to be a:ssociated with 
the terrorist organisation; or 

(c) who, with intention to further the actiVity 
of a terrorist organisation, addresses a meeting 

. fot the purpose of encouraging su.pport for the 
terrorist orgar;isation or to further its activity, 

(2) A person,who commits the offence relating 
to support givento a- terrorist organisation under 
sub-section (1); shall be punishable with 
imprisonment for a term not exceeding ten years, 
or with fine, or 'with both; 

40. Offence of raising fund 'for a terrorist 
organisation.- (1) Apetson commits the offence 
of raising fund for a terrcrist organisatIon, who, 
with intention to further the activity of a -terrorist 
organisation,-

(a) ihVitesanother person t6 provide money 
or other property, and Intends that if should 
be used, or has reasonable cause to suspect that 
it might be used,. for the purposes of terrorism; 
or 

(b) receives money· or other property, and 
intends thatit shoul<;l be used, or has reasonable 
cause to suspect that it might be used, for the 
purposes of terrorism; or 

(c) provides money or other property, and 
knows, or has reasonable cause to suspect; that 
it would or might be used for the purposes of 
terrorism. 



1/ 

628 OFFICIAL GAZETTE - GOVT. OF GOA 
SERIES I No. 29 

Explanation.- For .thepurposes of this sub­
-section, a reference to provide money or '. other 
property includes of its being given, lent or 
otherwise made available, whether or not for 
consideration. 

(2) A person, who commits the offence of raising 
fund for a terrorist organisation under. sub-section 
(1), shall be punishable with imprisonment for a 
term not exceeding fourteen years, or with fine, or 
with both.· 

CHAPTER' VII 

Miscellaneous 

41. Continu~ce of association.~ An association 
shall not be deemed to have ceased to exist by 
reason only of any formal act ofitsp.issolution or 
change of name but shall be deemed to continue 
so long as any actual combination for the purposes 
of such association continues between any 
members thereof. 

42. Power ,to delegate._The " Central 
Government may,. by notification in the Official 
Gazette, direct that all or any of the. powers which 
may. be exercised by it under .sectiqn 7, or section 
8, or both, shall, in such circumstances and under 
such conditions, if any,. as may be specified, in the 
notification, be .exercised also, by any .State 
Government Illld the State., Government may, with 
the previous approval of the, Central GoyerpJUent, 
by order in writing, directthatany.power)IIThich 
has been directed to be exercised by it shall, in 
such. circumstances and l;lIlder such conditions, if 
any, as may.be ,specified in the direction, be 
exercised by, any person subordinate to the State 
Government ,as may be specified therein. 

'-..... , - : 
43. Officf!.rs competent to investigate offences 

under Chapters,IV and VI.,..;.... Notwithstanding 
anything contained in the Code, no pOlice officer,-

I • • _ • 

(a) in the case of the Delhi Special 
Police Establishment constituted unde, , 
sub-section (1) of section 2 of the Delhi "'- , 

, ~~ 

Special Police Establishment Act, 1946, 25~1946, 
below the rank of a Deputy 
Superintendent of Police or a police 
officer of equivalent rank; 

(b) in the metropolitan areas of Mumbai, Kolkata, 
Chennai' and Ahmedabad and any other 
.metropolitan area notified ,as such under sub­
-section (,1) oisection 8 of the Code, below the rank 
of an Assistant Commissioner of Police; 

14THOCTOBER,2004 

(c) in any case not relatable to clause, (a) or 
clause (b).belowthe, rank ,of a Deputy 
Superintendent of Police or a p()lice officer of,an 
equivalent rank, 

shalUnyestigateany offence .punishable under 
Chapter IV or Chapter VI. 

44. Protection of witrfesses.-c- (1) 
Notwithstanding anything contained in the Code, 
the. proceedings under this Act may, for reasons 
to be recorded in ,writing, be held in camera, if the 
court So desires. 

(2) A court, iion an applicaticln made by a 
witness iriany proceeding before it or by the Public 
Prosecutor.in relation to such witness or on its own 
motion, is satisfied that the life of such witness is 
in danger, it miry, f()rr'aaso~s tobe recorded In 
writing, take such.measures asit deems fit for 

'keeping the identity arid ,addreSS of s~Ch witness 
secret. 

(3) In particular, and without prejudicetothe 
generality of the proviSions of sub-se9tion (2), the 
measures which a court may take under that sub­
section may inClude-

. (a) the holding of the proceedings at a place 
to be, decided by the c()uri: 

(b) the avoiding of the mention of the name 
and address of the witness in ,its orders or 
judgments or in any records of the case 
accessible to public; 

(c) the issuing of any directions for securing 
that the identity and address oithe witness are 
not disclosed; 

(d) a"Qecisionthat it is in the public interest to 
order that all or any of the proceedings pending 
before such a court shall not be published in 
any manner. 

(4) Any person, who contravenes any dedsIon 
or direction issued under sub-section (3), shall be 
punishable with imprisonment for a term which 
may extend to three years, and .shall also be' liable 
to fine. 

45. Cognizance of offences.-No court shall take 
cognizance of any offence-

(i) under Chapter III without the previous 
sanction of the Central Government or any officer 



I 

OFFICIAL GAZETTE - GOVT. OF GOA 629 
14TH OCTOBER, 2004 SERIESINo. 29· 

authorised by the Central Goveriunent in this 
~ behalf; 

(ii) under Chapter IV or Chapter VLwithoutthe 
previous sanction of the Central' Government or, 
as the case may be, the State· GOVernmEmt, .and 
where suchoffl:mce is committed against' the 
Government· of a foreign cOuntry without the 
previous' sanction of the' Central Government; 

. . 

46. Admissibility of evidencepollected .... 
through the interceptio.ll of comnlu~ .' 
nications.- Notwithstalldinganything 
contained in, the Indian Evidence Act, 
1872 or -any other .law .for. the time being - 1011872. 

in force, the evidence, collected through 
the interception of wire, electronic or oral· 
communication,under·the provisipnsof 
the Indian Telegraph,A,ct, 1885 or ,the 130(1885, 

Information Technology Act, 2000 pr any 21012000, 

other law for the time being in force,shall ' 
be admissible· as· evidence against the 
accused in the. court during,tb,e trial· of a 
case: . 

Provided that the contents of any wire, electronic 
or oral communication intercepted or evidence 
derived therefrom shall not be received in 
evidence or othervise disclosed.in any trial, hearing 
or otheL prO,ceeding: in any court ,unless each 

. accused:has 'been furnished with a copy of. the 
order of the competent' authority:under the 
aforesaid·Jaw, under'which·the interception was 
directed, noi"less than ten days befOrettial;hearing 
or proceeding: 

Provided further that the period of ten days may 
be waived by the judge trying the matter, if he 
come~ to the conclusion that it was not possible to 
furnish'the.;:iccused with slich order ten days 
before the trial, hearing or proceeding and that 
the accused shall not be prejudiced by the delay 
in receiving: such. order. 

47. Bar~; jurisdiction.-:- (1) Save a~~r.wise 
expressly provided in this Act, no proce~'cting. 
taken under·'this Act by the Central Government 
or the District Magistrate or any officer authorised 
in this behalf by the Central Government or the 
District Magistrate, shall be called in question in 
any civil court in any suit or application or by way 
of appeal or revision, and no injunction shall be 
granted by any civil court or other authority in 
respect of any action taken or to be taken in 
pursuance of any power conferred by or under 
this Act. 

.(2) Notwithstanding anything contained in 
sub-section:(l),nocivilcourt or other authority 
shall have, ·.or· be entitled to exercise, any 
jurisdiction, powers or authority in relation to the 
matters referred to in section 36. 

, . 48. Effect of Act andrules,etc.; inconsIstent with 
other enactments.- The provisions. of this Act or 
any rule or order made thereunder shall have effect 
notwithstanding anything inconsistent there.with 
contalned in any enactment other than this Actor 
any instrument. having effe,ct by virtue.of any 
enactment other than this Act. 

49. Protection of action taken in good faith.­
No suit, prosecution orother.legal proceeding shall 
lie against-'-' 

(a) the' Central Government or a State 
Government or. any officer' or authority of the 
CentraLGo.vernment .or State Government, or 
District Magistrate or any officer authorised in this 
behalf by the Government or the District Magistrate 
or any other authority ori whom powers have been 
conferred under this Act, for anything which is in 
good faith done or purported to be done in 
pursuance of this Act or any rule or order made 
thereunder; and 

(b) any serving or retired member of the armed 
forces or paramilitary forces in respect of any 
action taken or, purported to be taken by him in 
good faith, in the course of a."lY operation directed 
towards combating terrorism, 

. 50. Saving.- Nothing in this Act shall affect the 
jurisdiction exercisable by, or the procedure 
applicable to, any court or other authority under 
any law relating to the navy, army or air force .or 
other, armed forces of the. Union. 

51. Impounding of passport and arms licence of 
person chargesheeted under the Act.-Not­
withstanding anything contained in any other law 
for the time being in force, the passport and the 
arms licence of a person, who is charge-sheeted 
for having committed any offence under this Act, 
shall be deemed to have been impounded for such 
period as the court may deem fit. 

52. Power to make rules.- (1) The Central 
Government may, by notification in the Official 
Gazette, make rules for carrying out the provisions 
of this Act. 



630 OFFICIAL GAZETTE ~ GOVT.OF GOA 
SERIES I No. 29 

(2) In particular, and without prejudice to the 
generality of the foregoing powers,such rules may 
provide for all ot any of the following matters, 
namely:~ 

(a) the service of notiCes or orders issued or 
made under this Act an.d the manner in which 
such notices or orders may be served,where 
the person to be served is a corporation, 
company, bank or other association; 

(b) the procedure to be followed by the 
Tribunal or a District Judge in holding any 
inquiry or disposing of any application under 
this Act; 

(e) determination of the price of the .forfeited 
property under sub-section (2) of section 28; 

(d) the procedure for admission and disposal 
of an application un.dersub-section (3) of section 
36; 

(e) the qualifications of the members of the 
Review Committee under sub-s.ection (2) of 
section 37; and 

(f) any other matter which is required to. be, 
or may be, prescribed. 

53. Orders and rules to be laid before both 
Houses of Parliament.""'" Every order and every 
rule made 'by the Central Government under this 
Act shall be laid as soon as may be after it is made, 
before each House of Parliament, while it is in 
session, for a total period ofthlrty days which may 
be comprised in one· session or in two or more 
successive sessions, and if; before the expiry of 
the session immediately following the session or 
the successive-sessions aforesaid, both Houses 
agree in making any modification in the order or 
rule or both Houses agree that the order or rule 
should not .be made, the order or rule shall 
thereafter have effect only in such modified~rm 
or be of no effect, ,as the case may be; so, howev~~ 
that any such modification or annulment shall be 
without prejudice to the validity of anything 
preViously done under that' order or rule. 

14TH OCTOBER, 2004 

[See sections 2(1)(m) and 351 

Terrorist Organisations 

1. BABBARKHALSA INTERNATIONAL. 
2. KHALISTAN COMMANDO FORCE .. 
3. KHALISTAN ZINDABAD FORCE. 
4. INTERNATIONAL SIKH YOUTH FEDERATION. 
5. LASHKAR-E- TAIBAjPASBAN -E-AHLE HADIS. 
6. JAlSH-E-MOHAMMED/TAHRIK-E-FUROAN. 
7. HARKi':I'-UL-MUJAHIDEEN/HARKAT-UL- ANSARI 

/HARKAT -UL- JEHAD-E-ISLAMI. 
8. HIZS'UL-MUJAHIDEEN/HIZB-UL-MUJAHIDEEN pm 

PANJAL REGIMENT. 
9. AL-UMARcMUJAHIDEEN.· 

10. JAMMU AND KASHMIR ISLAMIC FRONT. 
11. UNITED LIBERATION FRONT OF ASSAM (ULFA). 
12. NATIONAL DEMOCRATic FRONT OF BODOLAND . 

(NDFB).· . • 
13. PEOPLE;S LIBERATION ARMY(PLA) .. 
14. UNITED NATIONAL LIBERATION FRONT (UNLF).· 
15. PEOPLE'S REVOLUT!ONARY'PARrY OF . 

KANGLEIPAK (PREPAK). 

16. KANGLEiPAK COMMUNIST PARTY (KCP). 

17. KANGLEI YAOL KANBA LUP (KYKL). 

18. MANIPUR PEOPLE'S LIBERATION FRONT (MPLF). 
19. ALL TRIPURA TIGER FORCE. 
20. NATIONAL LIBERATION FRONT OF TRIPURA. 
21. LIBERATION TIGERS OF TAMIL EELAM(LTTE). 
22. STUDENTS ISLAMIC MOVEMENT OF INDIA. 
23. DEENDAR ANJUMAN. 
24. COMMUNIST PARTY OF INDIA (l\IIARxIST- LENINIST) 
.. PEOPLE'S WAR, ALL ITS FORMATIONS AND 

FRONT ORGANISATIONS; 
25. MAOIST COMMUNIST CENTRE (MCC), ALL ITS 

FORMATIONS AND FRONT ORGANISATIONS. 
26.ALBADR. 
27. JAMIAT-UL-MUJAHIDDEN. 
28. AL-OAIDA 
29. DUKHTARAN-E-MILLAT (DEM). 
30. TAMILNADU LIBERATION ARMY (TNLA). 
31. TAMIL NATIONAL RETRIEVAL TROOPS (TNRT). 
32. AKHIL BHARAT NEPALI EKTA SAMAJ (ABNES).'. 

AP'J.ABDUL KALAM, 
President. 

T. K. VISWANAT.HAN, 

Secy. to the Govt. of India. 

GOVERNMENT PRINTING PRESS; 
P ANAJI - GOA. 
Price: Rs. 16.00 

t 


